L

9~ \2NY

GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF PFLH! 4 Trg. & Teuti. fiduost ;""

BN,

: yay ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS DEPARTMENT | e
/\?\ © 7™ LEVEL, C-WING, DELHI SECRETARIAT, I.P. ESTATE, NEW DELHL . |
L kv fid b

No.F.3/03/2013/Misc/AR /] H e"'l 3 - \S’) YA a

Office Memorandum

Subject : Appropriation of Provident Funds dues paid by the
Government

Additional Central Provident Fund Commissioner (DL.&Uk), Employees
- Provident Fund Organisation, Ministry of Labour and Employment, Government of

India, has vide his DO letter no.ACC/(DL & UK)/Cént.Emp/CoordNoIII/ZOll/ 1190

dated 10-9-2014 (copy énclosed) informed that Provident Fund dues paid by
Government Departments to various contractors are not fully/partly deposited

g with the concerned regional PF Commissioners (RPFCs) in respect of manpower
M deployed through contractors such as Data Entry Operators, housekeeping or

7 @Z z other staff/casual workers. He has accordingly drawn attention to the requirement
of preventing illegal theft/misappropriation of the same in the interest of

contractual enﬁpl'oyees as said funds are meant for payment of old age Provident
% Fund /pension, widow/disablement pension and insurance benefits.

The Organisation has pointed out that investigations regarding PF compliances
QW by the contractors has brought out certain common practlces adopted by the —
r contractors for /regarding misappropriate PF contrlbutions of the workers, thus
priving them of benefits of PF, Pension and insurance. '
. It has been suggested that in order to curtail these malpractices, all the
w\’\‘ Officers and DDOs shouT::l make themselves aware of the modus operandi of the

W contractors. He has further opined that that non applicability of EPF Act upon

employees drawing more than Rs.6500/- has now been amended and the wage
m&r\\aﬂs been enhanced from Rs.6500/- PM to Rs.15000/- PM by a Government
Notification(copy enclosed). He has also listed simple precautions to prevent

misappropriation. M

(\!v ;V W Contd...2/
ZAld |




The letter also mentions method of giving information regarding less remittance
or non-remittance of PF contributions into the PF account of contractual employee
for further statutory actions against the contractors under the relevant Act and as
well as IPC.

In this regard, it is informed that the Provisions of EPF Act are to ensure the
financial security to the otherwise low paid employees which allow them or their
dependents to meet any eventuality In their life. Thus, it is incumbent upon all

the Government departments and Government controlled .organisations and

bodies to ensyre that Provident Fund dues paid by the Government are de%d
by the contractors with the appropriate authority as per provisions of the law.

It is, therefore, reques?;&;t—hat DDOs ancWeOffk:mler your
control are made aware of the Provisions of the Act and common malpractices
committed by the Contractors to misappropriate the payments made by the

Government for said purpose and prevent such malpractices of public money paid
to the contractors, to meet statutory requirements.

—2.\ b w\V\

(V.C.Pandey,IAS)
Special Secretary(AR)

No.F.3/03/2013/Misc/AR / IMG72-15132 ) . Dated: 91 ] nhy
Copy to: |

(1) Al Principal Secretaffes/Secretaries, GNCT of Delhi

(2) AIIII‘:lleads of Department/Autonomous Bodies/Corporations/Boards, GNCT of
Delhi

(3) Heads of Local Bodies

Special' S'ecreta ry(AR)

24



Wﬁuﬂﬁwﬁfﬁwgﬁ(ﬁc—vﬂam)

1 Bty ¢t
R OFFICE OF THE >/

. CENTRAL P.F. COMMISSIONER (Delhi & Uttarakhand)
(@erdt wfde AR o3/ vd SoTR Ty, R WBR) [
(Employeas' Provident Fund Organisation-Ministry of Labour & Employment, G.0.1)

: sy fAfY wa1,/Bhavishya Nidhi Bhawan

X L. Tane]a 28, WTHIRA® waw, edf oet, asiiRgy yveRewst Ry, R
28, Community Centre, 8th Floor, Wazirpur Industri -

e o (fé_ o -loor, pur industrial Area, Delhl-52

Addl. Central P.F. Commissioner (DL. & Uk) T e /e 01121878174

§-Hel/Emall : acc.diut@epfindia.gov.in

3o Mo /D.0. No.: Ace (D L&Ulc)/w-@wr/@ﬁ/w}-ﬁ/u

‘ f&=1® /Dated : [o,ac},““
Respected S gun S /H‘?D —

| would like to invite your personal attention to prevent illegal theft/
“misappropriation of Provident Fund dues paid by the Govt. Departments to various
contractors who grab it and do not fully/ partly deposit the same with concerned

Regional P.F. Commissioners (RPFCs) in respect of such D.E.O’s / housekeeping or other
staff/ casual workers deployed through such contractors.

2. From the investigations made by this office regarding P.F. compliances by the

contractors, in respect of employees deployed at various Govt. Departments / Agencies,
this office has listed out the most common practices adopted by these Contractors to
pocket the Provident Fund Contributions of the poor workers (_'ANNE_X'U'RE- 1), thus
depriving them of Provident Fund, pension and insUranb}e behéfité, it is felt that to take
steps to curtail these malpractices all the Officers and DDO’s be directed to make
themselves aware of the modus operandi of the contractors. Most common excuse
that EPF Act is not applicable on employees drawing more than Rs. 6500/ does not exist
now. A Notification enhancing the wage ceiling limit from 6500/- p.m. to Rs. 15000/?

b.m. has been issued ( ANNEXURE - Il ) and is also available on our website
www.epfindia.gov.in.

3. In this regard | would like to request you to issue suitable directions to all your Heads

of Offices and DDO’s to prevent misappropriation by taking simple precautions
(ANNEXURE ~ 11 ).

4. In case of any complaint against any contractor who is/ was not remitting or less
depositing P.F. contributions into the P.F. accounts of the contractual employees,
information in enclosed format ({ ANNEXURE — IV ) be furnished to concerned Regional
P.F. Commissioner { RPFC) for taking statutory actions under the EPF & MP Act/ u/s
406/ 409 of IPC for misappropriation of P.F. dues. Heads of Offices / DDO’s may also be

Cinentars & ale § o den Ao

PR Conpdenionn Gt e M
V"ﬂgg-‘“-- o sl Contauad e, i ™A
W/\Q’U/ W GNETH, ek maates ¢ HD ‘_X‘S—OQW
b e et Ry W



e L= .=

B { RS

dlrected to flle FIR's agamst contractors after getting the payment posutnoh verified from

the concerned RPFC’s / from our website. Territorial jurisdiction of RPFC’s is enclosed
(ANNEXURE V)

Your directions to DDQO’s and information sharing initiative will be instrumental

for social justice to your own contractual employees by way of old age PF/ Pensnon,
widow/ disablement pension and insurance benefits.

BTN %Qaul& .
Yours Sincerely
NEJA)

TO

Sh. Arun Baroka
Principal Secretary (AR)
Administrative Reforms Department

7" Level, C Wing, Delhi Secretariat
I.P. Estate

New Delhi— 110002.



) /
ANNEXURE -1 "/ c’"t

How the Contractors cheat Govt. Departments and swallow P.F. money paid by them.

Example (i} The contractors claim and get P.F. contributions @ 13.61% of the wages/ salary

from the Govt. Departments. it includes Employer’s Contribution to P.F. @ 12% and Admn. &
insurance Charges @ 1.61%. This 12% Employer’s Contribution together with employees
contribution, which is 12% of the wages / salary, deducted from the salary of such employee is
to be deposited in the Provident Fund & Pension Fund accounts of the individual employees.

For example a contractor claiming P.F. Employer contribution of 1361/- @13.61% on wages of

say 10000/- p.m needs to deposit 12% viz.. Rs. 1200/- (termed as Employer Contribution )

alongwith with 1200/- of Employees Contribution i.e. Rs. 2400/- in the Provident and Pension
Fund accounts of the employee . The Electronic Challan cum Return (ECR) of the said month
shall reflect a total of Rs. 2400/- as remitted dues in respect of the said employee, However,
the Contractor tends to reduce the' wages/ salary of the employee say to Rs. 4000/- { by either
breaking up the salary into various components like HRA, and other allowances or by reducing

the number of working days of the employee ) and remits only 24% (12% + 12% ) of Rs. 4000/-

which comes to a total of Rs. 960/- into the Provident and Pension Fund accounts of the

employee thereby pocketing Rs. 1440/- of the contributions meant for the said employee

(i1} In the above case if there are say 100 employees deployed through the said contractor at a
specific Govt: Department and the contractor adopts similar practice in respect of all.the
employees, he will thereby siphon off Rs. 1,44,000/- p.m. of the employees social security
money. Longer the périod of contract larger will be the misappropriation of funds.

{iii) It is also seen that at times the contractor do not remit the P.F..dues at all and pockets the
100 % contributions made by the Govt. Department/ Agency.

k3

Considering a large workforce of contract employees déeployed in Govt, Sector, the financial and
social impact of such practice is shocking. To play these tactics the contractors submit fake P.F.
Account Numbers of the employees, fake declarations/ undertakings that the Provident Fund is
being regularly deposited by him, he is also likely to submit fake ECR’s and e~challans. Further,

where the contractor has multiple clients he submits the e-challans of one client to other
clients as proof of P.F. deposit.,

It may also be noted that the above examples are only illustrative and not exhaustive



PANN I XU = -

] Fo Blo [W=-33004/99

REGD, NO. D, 1,-33004/99

The Gazette of Fudia

EXTRAORDINARY
/M U 3—I9-WTY (i)
PART 1]—Section 3—Sub~section ()
wiitere R}y
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
TF TS, Vphaw, ARG 22, 2014 /RTEW 31, 1936
NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, AUGUST 22, 2014/SRAVANA 31, 1936

H442)
No. 442}

my AR TR AFTHA

? i e, 22 smvew, 2014

ar.w.F. s08(w )—=d=rlt wRew R war wfiel wdw aWfRaw, 1952 (1952 W o) #
ura 7 & Ie-arr (1) ¥ wvg 9w e 5w wxw affRR W owdTT A g R AT
g el W AR sor et gvdw sRfwE, 1952 # o and B =Y % Rm
Fraffie T gant & guly-
1. () A & R wfie GBfYy @inm)@em, 2014 g oo

(2) 9% 01 fyaa, 2014 & waveft gnf
% F4eTh wiawy @AY deEr, 1982 %

(®) &TITE 2 F wvr (3) F 79 wow (i) # eex g gAw ofvr i o w0y R o g g
¥y i g By s,

(4) AT 26 F S9N (6) ¥ oz @ g A7 T A A e g g wA A

“Wﬂﬁm’fmw;
(1) mzsmim-‘w(z)*mﬁ,m‘.g:mm_(qwmm“. W
757 TRE FHIT T & yfeq R Ry omwm et st s g

(#1.8. 77-35012/1/2012 qea-N)

3297612014 "

sz/(

"[



2 'THE OAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PArT II—Sec. 3(i)]
e

froqoft: s ey P Do, 1952 Rais 2 Reme, 1952 F1 &1 ALHLR, 1509 BT WK F
ware, o I @S 3, 31 @ (i) ¥ weiw & vE o g s et £ a § Rataten

sttt gy e R T an-

S w584, fawiw 11 %€, 1959
(2) g . 1522, Reiw 18 R, "1960
(3 av.#1.f3, 201, Ris 8 wad, 1961
(4) a1%1.7%. 889, Reiw 19 wwgay, 1990
(8) arer. . 326(x), w4 78, 2001

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Dethi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 608 (E).—In excrcise of the powers conferred by section 5 read with Sub-section(1) of Section 7 of the

Employees’ Provident Funds and Misccllancous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Cenwral Government hereby

makes the following Scheme, further to amend the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952, nately:-
L (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees® Provident Funds {(Amendment) Scheme, 2014,

(2) 1t shall come into force an and from the 1* day of September, 2014.
in the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952,~

i~
.

{a) in paragraph 2, in clause (f), in sub-clause (if), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”, the
words “ fifteen thousand nupees” shall be substituted;

(b} in paragraph 26, in sub- paragraph (6), for the words "six thousand and five hundred rupees”, the words
“fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substiiuted;

(c) in paragraph 26A, In sub-p ph (2), ln the proviso, for the words “six \housand and five hundred
rupees”, wheraver they occur, the Words “fiftsen thousand rupees” shisll be substituted.

{F. No. $-35012/1/2012-88.11)

ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl, Secy,
Note:- The Employses' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 wes published in the Gazette of india, Part 11, Section 3. Sub-
section (1} dated the 2nd Seprember, 1952 vide notification fumber S.R.0. 1509 and the relevant paragraphs
were subsequently amended as follows:~— o
G.S.R. 584, dated the. ] lth May, 1959,
G.8.R, 1522, dated the [6th December, 1960,
G.S.R. 201, dated the 8th February, 1951,
(.5.R. 689, dated the 19th Dctaber, 1990,
G.5.R. 326 (E), dated the 4th May, 2001.
-

TN AR

¥
w§ fawdt, 22 e, 2014

W1 13.609 (&) —afardY wfrer R aar vt swiw sffwy, 1952 (1852 % 19) #t vy 7

34T (1) F w17 9fsg amr 60 g v afRdt B vl w0 U ¥ v wARrd B drr,
» 1895 % #frc Haivum F% & g AR S aart &, sraip-

Lo (1) wg s ST e (dehe) de, 2014 SR



{an 11-mE 303} ) g & UATE ; HEERT

2

(2) w01 e, 2014 F qur HE A0 ¥ sl grh
sedberf Ry Pror, 1052 ¥ (g e FroAr ¥ v § srfita) -3 F 39-4er 2 F wgw A 5

o 3% AT AT o BT AT A T ¥ T T Mg g vy #rer wfenRa R s

3.

g A % Gorm 6 % A (%) { 9w 4, Sl wd WA CAmE el Wy AR A,

1652 % 27-%" F s "o, Rrer ¥aw 3w ffy ® ¢ e 59T ¥ ACT FaAT F E e SAa e
fw AT

4,

A AT F R ¥ -

(%) F9-777 (1) 3. 3% weegw ¥ foe PafAfire sfenfits By sddr, Jmme.

“(4) Sorx Fer S T ofver =i St gorr St dvry P it awear # G £ ol & w12
T oy A vy ¥ ey A storerd) Ay ¥ e i vz & ot /R Pnft Afy & angfa s
wifE da gy o Fery Ay e w1 Rator 01 Reesr, 2014 7% 9 78 Yo 2y danF o
waTpTTRE srer € Bt srom, S B sfwae gy go dre st dy oyl aur 9EE A
£ yafo & o uitsaw g o w9 afammg & soandr &

297 5 Fvd e ey Y & waegm wmy g0 6 fif ¥ oa g o 8 sy F e
T AT TE T G AW A F AT s fe v e B F s Rem am e ®

@ I ¥ adww £ 2w F g vd o, 9 ou¥ Yo F oen ¥ Rrg 9w T F wY ¥ A
AT,
(@) T7-877 (2) ¥ wrgt FE A "12 wig” @ @i orsz W A 39w B ure art v sTRewiva B
AT,
(m) I9-477 (3) F -

() e T oW “mg AT 9N O TRRES00 Y ¥ RYTA 9T ‘4Rz BN WY
wRrenfia B s,

() weRE g Rar woomm
() -ty (3) & et RrofRfr ao-dry me=nfin B srom, wovw -
"(4) § vz, 2044 B Rafd ¥ sy aary e S Redrm o wtard % ey o wg g
wmmm#aﬁ*m%mwdmiﬁﬁ,%ﬁﬂm@?ﬁrﬁmmwﬁ
?ﬁgﬁ@m%kmmmﬁﬁﬁm%mmwﬁmmﬁ

7T & Il gwe N, TR g e § afdw dmw @ 8 Rufy § o7 afn ¥

TR e T sadta 3w R ¥ steta v o % Bro sz o e §

sfafts soem F e 16 R R X e g i
awﬁ&mmmm1m.2o14%%mﬁm%mﬁmm

70 7 >t B rfrr wfer A srge Rt coe § BRI sy @ R ;
mﬁ?mmﬁwﬁmmmmzﬁwm VIR

amﬁ;gsﬁﬁ;uﬁmmﬁ)[ﬁmﬂamﬁmﬁm.ﬁﬁfﬁwwﬁwm@a‘rﬁm
T STt B e & A B Sy A1 & o stz & e s 8 o & oy i
T8 7R ) 3R AT R 0 3 Prg P 7w e by

i Faarlt aftey B Froa 5 gty -
mmwmzmﬂfzﬂm%wﬁwﬁrﬁrmﬁm&mw's

\



3. qanhm%ﬁvu%sw-trmz)ﬁﬁﬁﬁmemﬁa T3 ATHE:-

i Forr A F41 § AU
“qur¥ 5 9w azer f mfys Yaq eurnias s 971 20143’*‘(%1’31117{ _ v
mmmmmm%mmmmwmmmamammm
wqt wfvrg ¥ sftream g ox Praffe § sodt’y

6. r{ammﬁmukﬁrqﬁ'uﬁmwmr‘mmm.mz

“y4. e iR e 3 P STE 80 & vt R @y ot P X - ufy A€ e R

T drey Bt ARy 7 sraar 58 o€ A arg it &Y v, S oft g7 &, & A 12% anda () &
fafafSe wrx ar 7 47 &1, 9 Ty Feew wfer '« # v R At s g w1 w1 g g

st T 3 Ry A 58 T B g ot 7 7 & wwnfiw AT B TR 8 T 7 Aoy &
THAT B : R -

FuT B O weargror s £ worar ¥ Ry e S § A IRFT Tad AR daqq 0w
yaf F =oqrfi o 9% Fa9 % wria Sea F g9 grm ;

g wg ot B admr voosy, afardt afeTe e A, 1971 % st et Raed & E

Forg afraT ' 3 argaTe weargrr wg-Ran Prgfy sl F = # sfiwfra o arfRer @ # P
s grey Fa e storamat a1 afdftes wforest sty S0

[sFr. 9. TX-35012/1/2012-7THTH-1{]

feoneft:. g Arwan # Retw 16 Fd9T, 1995 § aftrgwar d guH R 748(3) g v e v

a1 w7 el At f fts 14 weadt, 2013 € sfdgean gear wran @, 80(w.) gro e far am
1M

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd- August, 2014

G.5.R. 609(E}).— In exercise of powers conferred by section 6A read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of the

Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellancous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Gavernment hereby
makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees® Pension Scheme, 1995, namely:—

1. " () This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Pension (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
(2} W shall come inta force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014,

y |

2, In the Employces® Pension Scheme, 1995, (herainaflor referred to as the principal Scheme), tn'pnmgmph.}. in
sub-paragraph 2, in the proviso, for the words “rupees six thousand and five hundred", wheérever they occu, (he words
*{ifieen thousand rupees™ shall be substinned.

3 In the principal Scheme, in parsgraph 6, in clouse (@), after the words, figures snd leuter "or 27A of the
Empleyces' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952", the words “and whose pay on such date s less than or equal (o ffteen
thousend rupees”, shall be inserted.

F
4, . Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph | 1,

ta) for sub-paragraph (1) and the proviso thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
(1) The pensionable salary shall be th

g average monthly pay drawn in any manner including an piece rate basis
during contributory period of service in the span of sixty moaths preceding the dase of exit from the membership
of the Pension Fund and the pensionable salary shall b determined on pro-rata basis for the pensionable service
up 10 the 1* day of September,

2T, 2014, subject 10 2 maximum of six thousand and five hundred rupees per month
and (or the period thereafler at the maximum of fifteen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that if a member was not in receipt of flt pay during thé period of sixry months preceding the
day he ceased to be the member of the Pepsion Fund, the average of previous sixty months 1ul) pay drawn by
him during the period for which contribwion 1o the pension

. fund was recovered, shall be taken into account as
pensionable salary for calculating pension;



(s [1-av2 23)) QI W TR ¢ WY

{b) in sub-paragraph (2), for the figures and word 12 months”, wherever they aceur, the words “sixty months”
shall be substitused;

¢) in sub-paragraph (3),- : . .
( (iy for the words, lerters and figures “rup<es six thousend and five hundred/Rs. 6500, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees” shall be substicyed;
@if) the provixo‘shn!lbcomin?d. s i N
d) afer sub-paragraph (3). the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:- )
513) The cxisgiﬂnr:. members as on the 1% day of Seprember, 2014, who &t the aption of the employer and
employee, had been contributing on salary exceeding six thousend and five hundred rupees per moath, may on a

fresh option 1o be exercised jointly by the employer and employee continue to conlribute on salary exceeding
fifieen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that the aforesaid members have to cantribute s the rate of 1,16 per cent on salary

eycecding
fifieen thousand rupees as an additional contribution from and out of the contributions payable by the ¢ ees
for each month under the provisions of the Act or the nsles made thereunder:

Provided further that the fresh option shall be exercised by the member within u period of six months
from the 1* day of September, 2014:

Provided also that the period specified in the second proviso may, an sufficient cause being shown by

the member, be extended by the Regional Pravident Fund Commissioner for & fucther period not exceeding six
months:

Provided also that if no option is excrcised by the member within such period (including the extended
period), it shall be deemed that the member bas not opted for contribution over wage ceiling and the

canuributions 10 the Pension Fund made over the wage ceiling in vespect of the member shall be diverted to the
Provident Fund account of the member al

ong with interest as declared under the Employees™ Provident Fund
Scheme from time to time,

In the principsl Scheme in paragraph 12, in sub-parsgraph (2}, the following proviso shall be inserted, mamely:-
“Provided that the members' monthly

pension shall be determined on a pro-rata basis for the penstonable
service up 1o the 1" day of September, 2014 at the maximum pensionable salary of six thousand and five
hundred rupees per month and for the period thereafter at the maximum pensio

nable salary of fificen thousand
rupees per month”,

Ln the pﬁncipﬂl Scheme, for paragraph 14 the following paragraph shall be substituted, namely.-

“14. Benefits on leaving service before being eligible for monthly member's pension.. [{'a member has nol
sendered the eligible service specified in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 12 on the date of
the 58 years of age, whichever is carlier, such member shall be entitted to a withdrawal benefit as laid down ia
Table *D' or muay opt (o receive the Scheme certificate provided on the date he has not.anained $8 years of age:

. Provided that for calculating such withdrawal benefit, the wages at exit shal be 1he weighted average
of his wages at the end of every wage ceiling period: o !

Provided further that an existing me

service under the Employees’ Family Pensio
as per Table

exit, or on altaining

gnber shall reccive additional renun of contributions for his past
" th _ n Scheme, 1971, computed s withdrawal-cum-retirement benefits
A’ multiplied by the factor given in Table 'B* =,

‘ {FNo, §-35012/1/2012-58-1]
-

ARUN KUMAR SINHA,Add). Secy.
Note: The principal Schume was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Pant 11, Secti i

_ ) , . Y\ . Se 3, Sub-section (i), vide
notification number G.S.R. 748 (E), dated the 16th November, 1995 § ¢ e

BO(E) dated the 14th February, 2013. U ' s amendeds

fde nuliﬁcmioq number G.S.R,

a$ Reelt, 22 sen, 2014

~

: * Pre Rl o a8, sm—(
o) I AR S AW agag dmy (Reitex) drmm, 2014 wgemmy
3297 €L7)h-::_ '



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAQRDINARY [PARY LI—SEC. 3())]

(2) g 1 fagew, 2014 8 wardt g

T AT wgE i oAy, 1676 F (vagwdy g At & @ ¥ §2iia) W?ﬁ, it
SraT (1) ¥ ey g 9T A S oradt B e T g e TR ares wretiea ey s
3. o= T ¥ oors 22 ¥, 9T (3) |, -

Z

(%) W= (1) &, v@y O O A wvi wEF ke g7 odeg gare e v i fee
aﬂﬁ'f:

v

(&) FAFTY W, g g 9T @) swdm ersel ¥ wrx 7 twRg g T aw ey R
Eha]

4. & e # forars 22 F, av-bdoors (3) % e, Rwfdtae sw-Sours ssesnte far e,

ATHT:-

“(4) T Ao % stade Mo ioms 22 (1), (2) @@y (3), &9 O wiEer @, ® g sepre
ATV % arrar AT TR wiaer sur R sromt

(%19, 0®-35012/1/2012 TRTH-] ]

oyl wfardt Fate-daa A Do, 1976 Rmis 28 g, 1976 H&a a1.%1,f, 488(¥) 27T WA &

TR, FETATIW, WO L, WS 3, 35 wvw (i) ¥yl § 78 f o 5% Az # Owogar Aaia fan
T -

(h  wFR 1788, Raiw 07.12.1976

12)  wrarfr 848, Bwtw 01.05.1977

3)  wLELAL 320, RiE 20.02.1978

(4  wrwLF, 369, R 14.07.1978

(5) wrwLfE 67, fmiw 23.12.1978

(6 wrELE 1013, Peiw 12.09.1980

(  wLELR, 548, A% 03.10.1981

(9 =rw.f3, 828, Pt 14.08.1985

(%  wLwLfR 873, frats 20.08,1088 !
(10) w228, e 02.03.1989 |
(1) wWLHLR, 354, fEaiw 22.05.1990
(12) =S, 30, Rwiw 28.12.1950
(13) @ FM, 321, R 16.08.1981
(i) wELfR. 420, PAis 31.08.1992
(15 ALELRY. 176, Retw 07.03,1994
(16) =TE.MR. 334, Paiw 20.08.1997
(17)  #.F1.7. 238, Bai+ 13.0672000
(18) AW, 523(a), feiw 18.06.2010
U9 wrEnfR. g(w), RBwrw 08.01.2011
(20) wr#LfR. 83(a), REFi¥ 11.02.2011



(v H-&78 3(i)] S H URIR : SRR 7

NOTIFICATION
New Dethi, the 225d Awugust, 2014

‘ ge0TH ion 7 of
LS.R. 610 {B). —In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C tead with sub-secrion (1) of section
the Emplgyus‘ Provi(dzm Funds and Miscelleneous Provistons Ast, 1952 (19 of 1952), the C_eml Govemmcfxi hersby
makes the following scheme further to amend the Baployees' Depoali-Linksd Insurance Scheme, 1976, amely:-

1. (1) This Schere may be called the Employess’ Deposit-Linkad Insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
{2) 1t shali come into foree on and from the 1* day of September, 2014,

7 In the Ersployess® Deposit-Linked tnsurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafler referred to as the principal Schams), in

paragraph 7, In sub-paragraph. (1), for the words “six thoussnd five umdred rupees”, the words “fiftsen thousand rupess”
shall be substituted,

3. In the principal Scheme, in paragriph 22, in sub-peragraph (3),-

(a) in clause (i), for the words "six thousand five hundred nupecs”, the words. “fifteen thousand rupess” shall be
substituted:

{b) in the Bxplanation, for the words “rupecs sl thousand five hundred”, the words “fifteen thovsand rupeex”
shal) be substituted.

4. . Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(#) The benefit under this Scheme shall be further Incressed

by twenty percent in addition to the benetin
admissible under sub-paragraph (1),

(2) ar'(3) of paragraph 22, 25 the case may be."”.
{F. No. 8-35012/1/2012-88.1()

ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy.
Note:- The Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Schems, 1576 was published tn the Gazene of indis, Exuaordinary,
Part I, Section 3, Sub-section (i); vide number G.8.R. 488 (E) , dated the 28% Jyly, 1976 and subsequently amended as
follows:-

(4] QSR 1788, dated 07-12-1976
) GSR 648, dated 01-05-1977
(3) GSR 329, dated 20-02-1978
4) GSR 389, dated 14-07-1978
5) GSR 67, dated 23-12:1978
(6) GSR 1013, dated 12-09-1980

) GSR 548, dated 03-10-1981

(8) GSR 828, dated 14-08-1985
) GSR 873, dated 29-08-1986
(10)  GSR 228, dated 02-03.1989
(n QSR 354, dated 22-05. 1990
(12)  GSR 30, dated 28-12-1990
(13)  GSR321,dated 16-08-199]
(14)  GSR 420, dated 31-08-1992
{15)  OSR 176, dated 07-03-1954
(16) GSR 334.':;?;! 29-08-1987
(17 GSR 238, ddffed 13-06-2000
(18)  GSR 523(E), dated 18-06-2010
(19)  GSR9(E), dated 08-01-201}

(20) GSR 83(E); dated 11-02-201

Printed by the Manager, Qovemment of Indin Presy, Rin

Road, Msyspuri, New 2
and Published by the Coneroller of Publicatiang, Delh,i-? 10054? w Delti-} 10064




TS He Fho Wo-33004/99

REQD. NO,D.L33004%9

Do
4

aetwgug

EXTRAORDINARY
[ [ —@UY 3-IY-TUY (§)
PART 11—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
wifamn & werf
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

% foeeil, HUFETT, 2T 19, 20714/57a97 28, 1936
NEW DELRI, TUESDAY, AUGUST 19, 201 /SHRAVANA 28, 1936
W AT A= HAER
sifirg=n
¥ 1, 19 3T, 2014

w5933, it wfng il g sl syEy sfufm, (952 (1952 @ 1y) ® W7 &)

30w (1) & W9 9fEm ura 6w gro v Rkl w1 WEn ST g w0 W A, SR 9o, 1995 § i
Wi w0 % e Prefafed 9 w1 8, afg .-

|8

i

Ee

€, 429)
Mo 429

(1) 9% durn sd=l 9 geen (Gds wviE) D, 2016 ST |

(2) 47 | Taasay, 2014 B 99 wER SRE |
2

AT ST A, 1995 (TARTUE el AR & w0 1 w3) § s (2 F 5 dee (7)
= wia, fr=fafea o0 dome s wadea feq g, sy, -

Y1) T8 T & eVt Freh framm st wER e wrrranf ) fed Y Twn wign wses w aifaes
¥ et 59 201415 ® WY F GF TR N R W o T

-

3. HE wrer ® YT 15, ¢ b= 12 % 38 Yo (03 8 (8) § sufterfa ), o), el o
Sl ® g SOars 12" W e e whwenfig feg s

4. qen T & s )6 -

(%) 34 homs (2) §, @vE (%) ¥, 3% @08 (iv) B 3909, Erafates o avs o wafi B soen,
Ui ;.

“ () et =l o farnt e, ofk @, wfes witis P S ofirr @ TR T W R, 9 e
4 2014-15 & FaA § wgre wfva o v w0 w5 e

(@) T Fumw (3) ¥, @ (@) & fan, frefelen we shatts e smom, we

U(@) W T T RS @ SR T T o (2) ® wee cow) 3 s En afas B tvm ® ww
faTa e =1 fen ) e of? % 25 i @ e o
3232 Ghnotd 1



TR

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY {Part li—Src. 3(1)

« g e fi P wren R i el 3 R e, W 9, ik e i A Y e g 201415 @ wEY
# vft e R A TEE ved X w9 w9

(1) w9 dumw (4) °, woE (%) B fae, Froffes wvs vt fom wnen, sigm -

(%) ufg faa wxer Fid TaciEd P 1 oy T W TRy SR @ v F S e swsid a= 8% 7l

¥ angar T AT A W, @ R 20 umw () $ ues (%) 7 sl nis Ren S D e F 3 o R 15 e
i S TIF W T E

v U6 i wee ararg w Ry owa, afk &Y, st spmm vt s S Bt o 2014 15 @ wen f vhm
[ R vE rd ¥ wE A e "

(1 €. 3= 15025/3/2007- CRE@A-%m-1])

wvu Far o, s wfae
o fearot « Hrar Ve WeEl, 1995 F TS 16 Fara, 1995 W SR Tem WowLf, 748( ) w0 yelw e

ar e frae wn gwd i 14 e, 2013 ¥ afvgen Sem ek 80() @ gro e few
L1l

MINISTRY OF LABOURAND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
Now Delhj, the 19th August, 2014,

GS.R. 593 (E):— In exercise of the powers copferred by section 6A, read with sub-section (1) of sectiva 7 of the
Employees® Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (13 0f 1952), the Central Govemment hercby makes
the following Scheme further 1o anyend the Employees® Penslon Scheme, 1993, namely;-

1 (1) This Scheme may be caliod the Employoes Pansion (Second Amendmen 1) Scheme, 2014,
{2) lt shall come into force on the 1§t day of September, 2014,
X

Z Inthe Employees’ Pension Scheme,

1995 (hereinafer referved to as the principal Scheme),
12, afier sub-paragraph (7), the following sub

in paragraph
~paragraph shal! be inserted, namely:-
“(7A) The monthly member's

pension including any relief payable to any existing or future member under this

paragraph shall not be less than gae thousand rupees for the financial year 2014-15.%,
3. Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph 15, for the words, brackets and figures “sub~paragraphs (2) to {$)of
paragraph 12, a3 the case may be,”, the word and figures " paragraph 12" shall be subslituted,

4 In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 16,

() in sub-paragraph (2). in clayse (2), after sub-clause (iv), ﬂ'xg following sub-¢lnuse shall be inserted,
namely:- ’
*(v) in all the cases, where the monthly widow pension including relief,' if any, is less than one thousand rupces
per month, thegmount of monthly widow pension in such cases shal) be enhanced to one thousand rupees per
month for the financial year 20 14-2015.™
(b) in sub-paragraph (3}, for clause (@), the follawing clanse shall be substituted, namely:-
“(b) Monthly children pension for each child shall be equal (Q 25 per cent of the ampunt admissible to the widow
of the deceased member as monthly widow pension paysble under clause (a) of sub-paragraph (2);

Provided that the minimum montkly children pension including relief, if any, for each child of the deceased
member shall not be less than twe hundred ang fifty rupees per montly for the financial year 20142015,

{c) in sub-paragraph (4), for clausc (), the lotlowing clause shell be substiuted, namely:-



11

1.2

1.3

1.4

il

1.6

1.7

1.8

ANNEXURE - ili

HOW TO PREVENT MISAPPROPRIATION OF P.F. DUES BY THE CONTRACTORS

in the tender for labour/ manpower supply contracts, compliance by contractors
regarding compliance of EPF & MP Act'1952, needs be spe;iﬂed alongwith other labour
laws, Names of contractors covered under the EPF & MP Act can be searched and
downloaded from website — epfindia.gov.in.

Principal employers/ D.D.0’s should get a copy of ECR, e- challan and salary/ wages
register reflecting P.F. deductions before releasing payments to contractors.

Under the statutory provisions, employee wise details of PF dues deducted from the
salary/ wages of the employees, alongwith 12% employer share are submitted in the form
of electronic challan cum return (ECR), thereafter, e ~ challan is generated from the EPF
website. Since the consolidated ECR’s of the contractor regarding manpower supplied to
all public and private sectors will be very bulky and will create confusion/ excessive time
and energy consumption at the level of DDOs, hence separate ECR’s and a separate e-
challan as stated above are very'impor'tant to prevent manipulations. Cheating by the
contractors can be prevented by deménding separate ECR and e-challan every month in
respect of manpower deployed in a particular office/ departments for which DDO is to

_release the payments to the contractors.

DDOs can check the name of all the employees with regard to ECR from the website of
EPFO i.e. epfindia.gov.in, =

EPF Organisation has provided a facility to the payment of dues with reference to
transaction number of e- challans. Whenever any challan' is - received alongwith ECR for
crediting PF dues in the accounts of individual members, a TRRN No. is generated for e-
challan. With reference to this TRRN No. actual deposit can be verified from the EPFO
website to prevegnt submission of fake challans by the contractors.

From April'’2012 onwards, monthly contributions recéived throuogh ECR and e-challans
are being credited in the individual members account within one month from the date of
deposit. Individual members can also verify the same by registration on the EPF website.
A DDO can ask any member at random to check whether the dues are being deposited by
the contractor fully without any manipulation/ mis-appropriation.

At the end of the year, EPFO generates statement of accounts of individual members
account reflecting opening balance, contributioné, withdrawals, interest and closing

balance etc. DDO should ask for distribution of these anhuél statements of accounts in the
Office/ Department.

Employees may be guided to obtain.e-passbooks from EPFO website.



{5 11-wve 3(1)] SRA %] TAGA ¢ ST

R 3

*(8) If the decensed member is not survived by any widow, but is survived by children falling within the definition
of family or if the widow pension is not payable, the children shall be eatitled to a monthly orphan pansion equal to 75 per
cent of the amount of the monthly widow pension as payabls under clause (a) of sub-paragraph (2):

Provided that the minimum monthly orphen pedsion ineluding relief, if any, for each orphan shall not be less than
seven hundred and iRy rupess per month for the financial year 2014-15.".
{F. No, R-15025/3/2007 SS-1/PLI1)

ARUN KUMAR SINHA ,Addl. Secy,
Foot Note.- The Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995 was poblistied in the Gazette of India vide notification number G.S.R.

748(E), doted the 16th November, 1995 and was lastly amended vide notification number G.S.R. 80(E), dated the
dth February, 2013,

i i = ——

Printcd by the Mansger, Qovernment of Indiz Press,

and Published by the Contraller of Publicatiuns, Delhi-110054
1

Ring Roud, Mayapur, New Delhi-110064 -

7

/



(u

PROFORMA FOR DDOs TO ENSURE COMPLIANCE FROM THE CONIHACIUR £51ASLISHEMNI

Name of the Hospital/Deptt alongwith address
Name and address of the Contractor - Ni/s B
PF Code no. of the Contractor establishment
Financial Year/period : ) il
fi -
S. No.| Emp_ | Name | Fathers PF Wages (Monthwise) fotal |Total {Total Total PF | Actual ]
V)
PFno | ofthe | name {PF Wages of March paid in April & so on) . f Wages |[Employ |Employer [dues PF Dues
emp y ee Share deposite
A 9. Share d
Mar | Apr | May | Jun il | Aug | Sep | Oct | Nov | Dec [ Jan | Feb | (sumofS | (12% of | (13.61% of | (Sum of
" ©18) fsn-17)! Sno.17) | 18+19)

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) 1 (6. (m | (8 | (9) | (20) | (11) | (22)](13) | (14)] (25} ] (16) - _(17) (18) (19) (20) (21)

1 -y 0 0 0 o
|z . 0 0 0 0

5 ] 0 0 o}

ol =

4 4 8 ( 0 0 0 0

5 ' 0 0 0 0
Total J _91 0 0] 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 o} (3} 0 0 0

E Signature of the DDO

N
A

T I g s s o5

b

pereis

me and stamp of the Official



Bhavishya Nidhi Bhawan, 28, Commun_fty Centre, Wazirpur Industrial Area, Delhi-110052
£/ E-Mail: ro.delhi.north@epﬁndia.govlin . Tele no. :- 011-27376772, Fax - 011-27376777

List of Pincode

falls under the Territorial Jurisdiction of

Regional office Delhi (North)

Name of the RPEC - Dr. V.P. Singh, RPFC-|

Apnexure-V

.
=

i

$.No. Pincode Area S.No. | Pincode Area
1 110001 Connaught Place 28 | 110039 Bawana/Barwala
2 110002 Darya Ganj 29 110040 Narela/Bhorgarh
3 110003 Lodhi Road 30 110041 Peeragarhi/Nangloi
4 110004 Rashtrapati Bhawan 31 | 110042 | Badli/Pehladpur/Siraspur
5 110005 Karol Bagh 32 110043 Najafgarh
6 110006 Chandni Chowk 33 110045 palam Village
7 110007 Shakti Nagar/Kamla Nagar 34 110046 Nangal Raya/Sagarpur
batei Nagar Ashok Vihar/Wazirpur indl
8 110008 35 110052 Area
Civil Lines/Timarpur
9 | 110009 izl 36 | 110054 /University
10 110010 Dhaula Kuan, Delhi Cantt 37 110055 Paharganj
1541 110011 South Avenue, Niraman Bhawan 38 110056 Shakur Basti
12 | 110012 Inderuri, IARI{PUSA) 39 110058 Janakpuri/Tihar Jail Road
. : Jeevan
4 10013 Dizaguac 20 1A00ES Park/Matiyala/Uttam Nagar
110015 Kirti l\fagar/moti Nagar 41 110060 Rajinder Nagar
14 110018 Tilak Nagar/Khyala 42 110061 Shahbad Mohammadpur
15 110021 Chanakyapuri /moti Bagh 43 110063 Madipur/Paschim Vihar
16 110022 R.K.Puriam/South Delhi Campus 44 | 110064 Mayapuri/Harinagar
ol o ' Bhikaji Cama Place/
17 110023 : 45 110066 Mohammadpur
18 110026 Punjabi Bagh 46 110071 Chawla/Jharoda
19 110027 Rajouri Garden/Subhash Nagar 47 110073 Dhansa/Issapur/Raota
20 110028 Najafgarh 48 110075 Dwarka
21 110029 Safdarjung Enclave 49 110078 Kakrola/NSIT Dwarka
- Geora/Jaunti/Kanjhawla
22 | 110033 RSP RAgaE sadugy so | 110081 Mubarakpur :
23 110034 Shakurpur/Rani bag’h/Pitampura 51 110082 Holambi Kalan/Naya Bans
24 110035 Keshavpuram/inderlok/Rampura 52 110083 Mangolpuri
25 110036 Alipur/Bakhtawarpur 53 110084 Burari/Jharoda Majraa
26 110037 Mahipalpur/IGl| Airport 54 110085 Rohini/Rithala
; Sl Begumpur/Budh
27 | 110038 Rejokn 55 | 110086 Vihar/Sultanpuri
28 | 110039 Bawana/Barwala 56 110087 Jwalapuri/Sunder Vihar
57 110088 Haiderpur/Shalimar bagh




Pu 7 List of Pincode falls under the territorial jurisdiction of
1 Regional office Delhi (South)
: Name of the RPFC - Shri Beerbal Meena, RPFC-| 7
EPFO Complex, Plot nO. 23, Sector-23, Dwarka, New Delhi-110075
Email : ro.delhi.south@epfindia.gov.in, Tele :- 011-28050759 Fax : 011-28050412
S.No. jPincode  |Area Y
1 110016|Green Park/Haus Khas
2| 110017|Malviya Nagar/Saket/Chirag.Delhi
3 110019|Nehru Place, Tuglakabad Extn. -
4]  110020{Okhala Industrial Area
5 110025{Jamia Nagar
6 110030{Mehrauli
71 '110038|Bijwasan
8| 110044|Badarpur/Mohan Cooperative
9 110047 {Aya Nagar, Arjun Garh
10 110048 |Greater Kailash
11}  110049{South Extn./Shahpurjat
12 110057 Vasant Vihar
13| 110062|Khanpur/Dakshinpuri
14|  110065|New Friends Colony/East of Kailash
15 110067 |Munirka, JNU
16} 110068|Neb Sarasi/IGNOU
171 110070)Vasant Kunj/Masudpur
19 110074|Chattarpur/Satbari
20{ 110079
List of Pincade falls under the Territorial jurisdiction of
Sub-Regional office Jhilmil o

Name of the RPFC - Smt. Nidhi Singh, RPFC-11/0IC

DSIIDC Facility Centre Building, Flatted Factory Complex, 2nd & 3rd Fioor, Jhitmil lndustnal Area

(Behind Dilshad Garden Metro Station), Delhi-110095

email sro.laxminagar@epfindia.gov.in , Tele :011-22126504 , Fax :- 01 1.22126502

S.No.

Pincode JArea L

110014|8hogal/langupra

110024 }Lajpat Nagar

110031|Gandhi Nagar

110032|Shahadra

110051 {Krishna Nasgar

110053 |Ghonda

110091 |Mayur Vihar

olol~N|laojulsiwinie

110092 Patparganj/Laxmi nagar

110093|Nand Nagari b

=
o)

110094 {Karawal Nagar

e
=

110095} shilmil (Dilshad Garden)

oy
NS

110096|Mayur Vihar, Ph-1i

1,

fe





